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THE GLIDING FEDERATION OF AUSTRALIA INC

ABN: 82 433 264 45
LEVEL 1, 34 SOMERTON ROAD, SOMERTON, VICTORIA 3062
PHONE +61 (0) 3 3303 7505, FAX <61 (0) 3 9303 7960

Medical Practitioner’s Certificate of Fithess

Pilots who are unable to make the declaration at Appendix 1 of the GFA Operational Regulations
must have this certificate signed before fiying a sailplane as pilot in command.

caged

Canberra ACT 2601
ABN: 44 B0B 014 470

The medical standards applicable for the issuing of this Certificate are the Austroads
standards for the issue of a driver's licence medical certificate for a private motor vehicle.
These standards are to be found at:

hitp-/iwww austroads com au/driver- fitness-to-drive

Pilots who hold a GFA Instructor rating or wishing to hold a Charter authorisation and do not hold a
valid CASA Flight Crew Licence Medical Certificate must also have this Certificate signed, regardless
of having made the declaration at Appendix 1.

NOTE FOR THE MEDICAL PRACTITIONER: As with the Austroads driver's licence medical
cerfification, the examining registered medical practitioner acts as the certifying physician. He or she
must be familiar with the Austroads standards for the issue of a driver's licence medical certificate for
a private motor vehicle. When faced with an applicant with a medical condition, reference must be
made to the appropriate chapter of the Austroads guidelines. The standards contained in ‘Assessing
Fitness to Drive' are guidelines only and health professionals are encouraged to use their professional
discretion and to take into consideration the full picture of a person's health

| hereby certify that | have examined the applicant (name)

of Post Code

and to the best of my knowledge helshe is not suffering from a megical condition which would
preclude himiher from flying a sailplane as pilot in command

This Certificate shall be valid for a maximum of two years in respect of a pilof aged 40 or over at the
fime of the examination, or for a maximum of four years in respect of a pilot aged under 40 at the time
of examination.

(Please use remarks section below if the validation period is to be varied)
D Initial certificate D Renewal (Tick as appropriate)

Remarks (as applicable)

Doctor's Name (please print)

Signature Date

Form OPS FODS({b) August 2013

THE GLIDING FEDERATION OF AUSTRALIA INC
ABN-82433 264 25
LEVEL 1, 34 SOMERTON ROAD, SOMERTON, VICTORIA 3062
PHONE +61 (0} 3 9303 7505, FAX 61 (0] 3 8303 7350

Declaration of Physical Fithess

Note: This declaration is to be made annually by members who intend to iy as “pilot in command”
and do not hold a valid CASA Medical Certificats or a Medical Practitioner's Certificate of Fitness in
the form at Appendix 2 of the GFA Operational Regulations.

L (name) of.
(address) PostCode.........

hereby declare that to the best of my knowledge | am not suffering from any physical condition that
would preclude me from operating a glider as pilot in command.

| further declare that | do not suffer or have not suffered from

* Heart failure within the last 3 years

Cancer in the last 5 years

ECG changes

Insulin dependent diabetes

Transient ischaemic attacks (sometimes referred o as a mini stroke)
Multiple sclerosis, cerebral palsy, Parkinson's disease

Significant head injury

Renal calculus disease (kidney stones)

Vestibular disorders (vertigo)

Inability to hear conversational voice at a distance of 2 metres (a hearing aid
may be used)

Physical limitations or disabilities

In the event of my contracting any physical condition precluding me from operating a glider as pilot in
command, | undertake to the Gliding Federation of Australia that | will cease flying in that capacity
while the condition makes it unsafe for me to do so.

Pilot's signature Date

Signature of parent or guardian
(for persons under 18 years)

Note: Members who are unable to make this declaration may obtain a medical clearance to fly as pilot
in command in the form at Appendix 2.

This declaration shall remain valid for a period of one year only

Form OPS FOD6({a) August 2013



Acceptable Medical Certificates

Australian Government Form 166C

I Civil Aviation Safety Authority Recreational Aviatian Medical

Recreational Aviation Medical Practitioner’s Certificate
Only an unmedified verson of this form can be submitied 1o CASA. The patient and the GP should read CASA's Guidance
for GPs Ass Persons for a Recreational Aviation Medical Practitioner's Certificate, available an CASA'S webs
{Guidance for GPs)

Section A: Patient Details and Declaration

Ful Mame |

Residential Address |

Stabe | ) ] Pastoods | | Couritry [

Contact Fhone | |"“H || | [ [ 1 11
I declare all t e by e o this application o t ying

15 ba rus and corael | eonsant 19 tha dester providing CASA with infamation abeut ma relevant 1o this medseal
‘assessment of my Sviation Snass,

Swanature: Date: i !
Section B: Doctor's Details and Certification
Full Nama Provider number
Email Address. Talephone numbar |
Poatal Address |
State | ] Postoode ] [ coumy |

| CERTIFY that, using CASA's Recreational Aviation Medical Practiioners Certificale and Medical Practiboner
Clinical Examinaton Proformas from CASA's Guikdance for GPs, | hawe sxamined Te abovementionsd pasent in
Acesrdares wih the Faabion Riness standards, baing the standards ler an unconditional privite motor vehichs drivees
leanca, a5 publahed by Austronds Ine.” amd modifisd by CASA for axcludsd conditions as sxplained in CASA's
Guidance for GPs.

| CERTIEY that in iy apinion, the patient

1. MEETS the aviation Siness standards for issue of a Recreational Aviation Medical Pracliioner’s Cenlificate
and DOES NOT have any of he dsqualfying condibions menboned in CASA's Guidance for GP's, the absence of
whith was exprossly determined by me.

2. 15 NOT related 1o me and | have nd conflict of interest in signing off this applcant

| was tamidiar with the patient’s medical history aver a peniod of years and manis bafoms ssung this

madical certificate.

[T] The patient must wear comsctive bnaes 3t all inos whon using this cerificats for aviation puposss

Date of examination ! ! Date cortificate expires™ ' '
Signature:
“The Ausrosds Inc. publcation Assessing f for T g for
" i was isued.
e nder b years 2years For " e 1year,

Form TEEANRNC) 02015 . TFrecreabonal &viaton Wedcsl Pracione:'s Ceriicate (RAMPC) Poge 1ol 14



Examples of Unacceptable Medical Certificates
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foid here

Review/expiry date
Medical Certificate Issue date {provide details 'gm question 8

AA I IAO ) O (7 A

Li.csnce _ei{pro_victs details from question 7).

Driving conditions/restrictions (provide details from guestions 6C and 9)

Doctor's details

Name (please PRINT)

Address and conact

Government of Western Australia
Department of Commerce

ICOMMERCIAL VEHICLE DRIVER MEDICAL ASSESSMEN
This Medical A meets the requi of the following Western Australian
Government Authorities;

Department of Commerce, WorkSafe - Occupational Safety and Health Regulations (1296)
Main Roads Western Australia - Heavy Vehicle Accreditation 2003

State Motor Vehicle Driver Medical -

Unacceptable

Important Information:

1. PLEASE READ THE INSTRUCTIONS ACCOMPANYING THIS FORM
2. COPIES OF PAGES 1 AND 2 OF THIS FORM NEED TG BE PROVIDED TO YOUR EMPLOYER, AS PROOF OF
FITNESS TO DRIVE A COMMERCIAL VEHIC! g
3. THE ORIGINAL OF THIS FORM - SHOULD BE KEPT BY YOU (THE APPLICANT), SO THAT ANY FUTURE
EMPLOYER CAN GET A COPY FROM YQU FOR THEIR RECORDS.
4, THIS FORM DOES NOT NEED TO BE SENT TO ANY WA GOVERNMENT AUTHORITY.
Applicant details — to be completed by the applicant
Famity 1 cansent ta the relavant Dapartmsnts
Name. _ mantianed abos contacting my Medical
Practitionar for any further informalion
relsvant fo thair assassman! of my fitness
Glven
names: | N
Birth i
| B ) Applicant's signature  Date
Driver Licenca Explry date;
Number Ak
el BN
@ncg spplication ) O Renewal af current licence

Were you familiar with the patient's medical history prier to this examinati

Assessment of Fitness to

to be completed by me:

o NO

If you answered no, to the above how long have you been treating this person. 2 g’m

Patient examined according to

Commercial vehicle standards

Commerci

O Private vehicle standards

el Vehicle Driver Medical Assessment form Pags 1 of

Commercial Motor Vehicle Driver Medical -
Unacceptable

Australian Government 166C
Civil Aviation Safety Authority

DRIVER LICENCE MEDICAL CERTIFICATE (AVIATION)

Only an unmadified version of this form can be submitted to CASA. The patient and the registered medical
practitioner {the Doctar) should read CASA's Guidance for GPs Assessing Persons for a DL Medicol Certificate
{Aviation), available on CASA’s website (Guidance for GPs).

¥ Potient details:
ramily name: NN Given Name: [
Date of Birth: NN ARN:
Address: -

Postal address (if different):

W Doctor's Certification
| CERTIFY that, using CASA's DL Medical Questionnaire (Aviation) and Medical Practitioner Clinical Examination Proforma
from CASA's Guidance for GPs, | have examined the abovementianed patient in accordance with the oviation fitness
stondards, being the standards for an unconditiona| private motor vehicle driver's licence, as published by Austroads Inc.”
and modified by CASA for excluded conditions as explained in CASA's Guidance for GPs.

| CERTIFY that, in my opinion, the patient:

1. MEETS the aviation fitness standards for issue of 2 driver's licence medical certificate (aviation}; and

2.~DOESNTT have any of the disqualifying conditions mentioned in CASA's Guidance for GPs, the absence of
which was expressly determined by me.

¥ Doctor's famitiarity with patient (delete if not applicable}
| was familiar with the patient’s medical history over a period of - years before issuing this medical

certificate.
Tick i appropriate:

D The patient must wear corrective lenses at all times when using this certificate for aviation purposes. I .

A

I, _ {patient nome] consent to the doctor providing CASA with information about
me relevant to this medical assessment of

Patient’s signature Date:

¥ Doctor's detalls
Full Name: rovider No.
Practice address:
Postal address (if different):

Bl lication vehicle drivers: far d

tnicol guideiines, being t+ v in o 3t the date this Gertificats was issued.
*Far a person 4¢d under 65 years — not excesding 2 years. For persen aged 65 years or over — not exceeding 1 year.

CASA Driver Licence Medical Certificate -

Unacceptable




Examples of Unacceptable Medical Certificates

HEAVY VEHICLE DRIVER'S LICENCE

Appendix 2
MEDICAL PRACTITIONER'S CERTIFICATE OF FITNESS pp
NOTE: This cerificate must be signed by & doctor in the event that you cannot make the declaration THE GLIDING FEDERATION OF AUSTRALIA
on the reverse of this form. This certificats shall have & validily of TWO YEARS.
MEDICAL PRACTITIONER’S CERTIFICATE OF FITNESS
| am the applicant's General Practitioner/a CASA Designated Medical Examiner (Delete as
appropriate) Pilots who are unable to make the declaration at Appendix 1 must have this certificate
signed before flying a sailplane as pilat in command.
| hereby certify that | have examined the applicant
The medical standards applicable for the issuing of this Certificate are as for the

(Name)... Austroads fimess to drive test — Private vehicie drivers. These standards are to be
found at: htip:: ds.com. aw/aftd/inde
and that to the best of my knowledge hefshe is not suffering from any medical condition which
wauld preclude him/her from (Delete as appropriate): Pilots who wish fo hold a GFA Charter authorisation and do nat hold a valid CASA
Flight Crew Licence Medical Certificate must also have this Certificate signed,
- flying in a sailplane with another qualifisd pilot rated on type regardless of having made the declaration at Appendix 1.

« flying solo in a sailplane

» carrying passengers in a sailplane for hire and reward 1 am the applicant’s usual
examined th

eral medical practitioner and | hereby certify that T have

(Delete as appropriate)

§ . o
Initial Certificate/Renewal Certificate. and to the best o he/skeis not suffering from a medical condition
om flying a sailplane as pilot in command

Remarks:

This Certificate shall be valid for a maximum of two years in respect of a pilot aged
40 or over at the time of the examination, or for a maximum of four years in respect
of a pilot aged under 40 at the time of examination.

(Please use remarks section below if the validation period is to be varied)

Initial certificate/renewal

T 1 Remarks: —

NOTE: ) Fon ; i e -
1. The medical standards for GFA glider pilots are those specifications fora

i licence, the specific guidelines for which can be viewed at. -
stroads.com.au/cms/AFTDZ 20web %21 006.pdf
dl are
/, Fits, Severe Head Injury, Recurrent Fainting, Giddiness, S
J7 rmally High Blood Pressure or previous Heart Disease or
- when the applicant is taking Insulin for the control of diabetes g

Do b Ao 2RI

ut-of-date Form - Unacceptable Out-of-date Form - Unacceptable Copy of Driver’s Licence - Unacceptable




Examples of Unacceptable Medical Certificates

SA COUNTRY FIRE SERVICE
State Training Centre
ABN No. 87 677 077 835
Pyrkes Rasd Phone: (08) 8398 9900
Brukunga 525 hone:
Su‘tlh';s:strel\s Facsimile: (08) 388 8957

“Safety First- Come Homa Safo” e-mall: efstraining@cts.sa.gov.au

SELF CONTAINED BREATHING APPARATUS WEARER MEDICAL

CONFIDENTIAL — DO NOT COPY

THIS ORIGINAL DOCUMENT MUST BE RETURNED TO THE CFS STATE TRAINING
CENTRE - COPIES OF THIS DOCUMENT WILL NOT BE ACGEPTED

INVOICE: THE INVOICE FOR THIS CONSULTATION MUST BE BILLED
TO THE PATIENT AND ATTACHED TO THIS FORM
INCLUDING A CLAIM FORM FOR PROCESSING. THANKYOU

PLEASE ENSURE ALL FIELDS ARE COMPLETED AND A CLAIM FORM IS ATTACHED

REASON FOR MEDIGAL
D Initial Breathing Apparatus Course Course attendance date:

1st November 2012
E/ Medical Renewal SCBA Project Manager:
To whom it may concern: Applicants Name:
Address:
Re: I
DOB: I Phane Mumber:
i 55 CUUNTRY FiHE SEHVILE
Membership Number: STATE TRAINING SERVICE
Date of Birth: HEUEW;:: s
: it is bei 15 MAY
This is to certify that [ N NN MEEo<5 1ot have any medical conditions that preclude his being Date of Medical; __10|oss| 1D

a slider instructor ay continue to perform in this role.
a glider instructor and may p Brigade:

This medical is valid for 6 (six) months from date of examination

SCBA MEDICAL APPEAL PROCESS:

Yours faithfully, 11 3 a resut of your CFS SCBA MEDICAL you have been idanlified a5 not meeting the medical requirements and
you wish to appeal the finding, please make contact directly to the Slals Training Gentre SCBA Project Manager on
8398 9928. There are avenues of appaal apen lo you to sesk a sesond opinion from a CFS appointed qualified
medical specialist.

NOTE: THIS DOCUMENT MUST BE PRINTED IN COLOUR

Pageiof8 WVersian 14.0 APRIL 2013

Declaration by GP - Unacceptable Workplace Medical Certificate - Unacceptable




